

3-Year Contract to Provide Laundry Chemicals, Dispensing Systems and Service; Spec #59-10/22						
No.	Description	Type	UOM	Quantity	Pariser Industries	
					Unit Cost	Extended total
1	Cost to launder one pound of laundry for Neshaminy Manor	Base	LB	5,100,000	\$0.0081	\$41,310.0000
2	Cost to launder one pound of laundry for Correctional Facility and Men's Community Corrections Center	Base	LB	3,750,000	\$0.0075	\$28,125.0000
3	Heavy Duty Liquid Laundry Alkali, Pariser Industries Bildex, 30 gallon drum as specified	Option	Drum	1	\$187.95	
3.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT to the specified Pariser 30 gal product	Option	Drum	1	No Bid	
4	Heavy Duty Liquid Laundry Alkali, Pariser Industries Bildex, 5 gallon bucket as specified	Option	Bucket	1	\$49.55	
4.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT to the specified Pariser product, 5 gal product	Option	Bucket	1	No Bid	
5	Concentrated Liquid Laundry Detergent, Pariser Industries N- Surf - P, 30 gallon drum as specified	Option	Drum	1	\$279.22	
5.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT to the specified Parsier 30 gal product	Option	Drum	1	No Bid	
6	Concentrated Liquid Laundry Detergent, Pariser Industries N- Surf - P, 5 gallon bucket as specified	Option	Bucket	1	\$53.77	
6.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT to the specified Parsier product, 5 gal product	Option	Bucket	1	No Bid	
7	Liquid Laundry Chlorine Bleach, Pariser Industries Bleach 15%, 30 gallon drum as specified	Option	Drum	1	\$111.68	
7.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT to the specified Parsier 30 gal product	Option	Drum	1	No Bid	
8	Liquid Laundry Chlorine Bleach, Pariser Industries Bleach 15%, 5 gallon bucket as specified	Option	Bucket	1	\$30.60	
8.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT to the specified Parsier product, 5 gal product	Option	Bucket	1	No Bid	
9	Liquid Laundry Sour, Pariser Industries Para Sour A/C, 30 gallon drum as specified	Option	Drum	1	\$248.53	
9.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT to the specified Parsier 30 gal product	Option	Drum	1	No Bid	
10	Liquid Laundry Sour, Pariser Industries Para Sour A/C, 5 gallon bucket as specified	Option	Bucket	1	\$55.20	
10.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT to the specified Parsier product, 5 gal product	Option	Bucket	1	No Bid	
11	Liquid Laundry Fabric Softener, Pariser Industries Soft XL, 30 gallon drum as specified	Option	Drum	1	\$204.62	

11.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT to the specified Parsier 30 gal product	Option	Drum	1	No Bid	
12	Liquid Laundry Fabric Softener, Pariser Industries Soft XL, 5 gallon bucket as specified	Option	Bucket	1	\$53.76	
12.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT to the specified Parsier product, 5 gal product	Option	Bucket	1	No Bid	
13	Liquid Enzyme Laundry Detergent Pre-Spotter	Option	Bottle	1	\$100.00	
14	Powder Degreaser, Pariser Industries Premier Intermediate #3.0124.005, 50 lb pail as specified	Option	Pail	1	\$147.95	
14.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT to the specified Parsier product, 50 lb pail	Option	Pail	1	No Bid	
					Total Extended	\$69,435.00
Low Bid						
Recommended for Award						