

<b>3-Year Contract to Provide Personal Cleansing Wipes; Spec #34-08/21</b>				
<b>Description</b>	<b>Item 1 - Personal Wipe Prevail Soft Pack Aloe Mfg# WW-710</b>	<b>Item 1.1 - Alternate to Prevail Soft Pack Aloe Wipe</b>	<b>Base Bid Total</b>	<b>Alternate bid total</b>
<b>Type</b>	Base	Option		
<b>Quantity</b>	3,873,600	3,873,600		
<b>Boss One Supply Inc</b>	No Bid	\$0.0240	-	\$92,966.40
<b>DELCREST MEDICAL SERVICES</b>	No Bid	\$0.0254	-	\$98,389.44
<b>ProcureNet America</b>	No Bid	\$0.0274	-	\$106,136.64
<b>Medline Industries, Inc.</b>	No Bid	\$0.0329	-	\$127,441.44
<b>Zoom Technologies LLC</b>	No Bid	\$0.0380	-	\$147,196.80
<b>Healthy School Supply LLC</b>	No Bid	\$0.0240	-	\$92,966.40
<b>Maven Medical</b>	\$0.03	\$0.0295	-	\$114,271.20
<b>Manheim Medical Supply Inc.</b>	\$0.0330	\$0.0396	\$127,828.80	\$153,394.56
<b>Pristine Dental Supplies Inc.</b>	No Bid	\$0.1200	-	\$464,832.00
<b>AGATHOS LABORATORIES INC</b>	\$0.05	\$0.0450	\$174,312.00	\$174,312.00
<b>Key 4 Cleaning Supplies</b>	\$0.00	\$0.0600	-	\$232,416.00
<b>TRINITY TLG LLC</b>	\$0.75	\$0.0000	-	\$2,905,200.00
<b>R.D.B. Enterprises II LLC</b>	No Bid	\$33.9400	-	\$131,469,984.00
Advertised in Newspaper				
Posted on PennBid				
88 Planholders				
13 Responses				
<b>Apparent Low Bidder</b>				
<b>Recommended for Award</b>				