

3-Year Contract to Provide Resident Socks, Gowns & Bibs; Spec #53-12/21								
Please note, the amounts shown are the numbers that were read at the public bid opening and do not reflect any evaluation and do not indicate an intent to award.								
All vendors listed below have been checked against the PA Department of General Services Debarment List and none are listed on the day of the bid opening.								
No.	Description	Type	UOM	Quantity	Malor & Company Inc	Personal Touch Health Care Apparel	AGATHOS LABORATORIES INC	Medzon
1	White ankle socks: 95% polyester/5% Spandex or 85% Acrylic/10% Nylon/5% Spandex; fits 9-11 Brand: American Health Care Apparel #WHS11-00W	Base	Pair	9,600.00	No Bid	\$0.60	No Bid	No Bid
1.1	ALTERNATE OF EQUAL PRODUCT	Option	Pair	9,600.00	No Bid	\$0.60	\$9.06	\$1.85
2	Non-skid socks: Acrylic and stretch yarns, latex-free, size large Brand: Confetti treads Item #90205	Base	Pair	1,152.00	No Bid	\$1.60	\$1.34	No Bid
2.1	ALTERNATE OF EQUAL PRODUCT	Option	Pair	1,152.00	No Bid	\$1.60	No Bid	\$1.25
3	Non-skid socks: Acrylic and stretch yarns, latex-free, size x-large Brand: Confetti treads Item #90207	Base	Pair	1,152.00	No Bid	\$1.75	\$1.36	No Bid
3.1	ALTERNATE OF EQUAL PRODUCT	Option	Pair	1,152.00	No Bid	\$1.75	No Bid	\$1.28
4	Non-skid socks: Acrylic and stretch yarns, latex-free, size 3x-large Brand: Confetti treads Item #90219	Base	Pair	576	No Bid	\$1.85	\$2.11	No Bid
4.1	ALTERNATE OF EQUAL PRODUCT	Option	Pair	576	No Bid	\$1.85	No Bid	\$3.81
5	Incontinent Pads: size 34" x 36", Reusable Polyester/Rayon, Moderate Absorbency, rounded corners, blue backing, Ibex, Brand: Becks Classic Item #7136HB	Base	ea	7,200.00	\$2.99	\$3.50	\$7.37	\$13.59
5.1	ALTERNATE OF EQUAL PRODUCT	Option	ea	7,200.00	\$2.99	\$3.50	No Bid	No Bid
6	Resident Gowns: 66" sweep 47' length, angel back tie closure, no snaps, wide neck, cascade print, Brand: Medline Item #MDTPG3RABCAB	Base	ea	4,500.00	\$2.99	\$3.50	\$6.19	No Bid
6.1	ALTERNATE OF EQUAL PRODUCT	Option	ea	4,500.00	\$2.99	\$3.50	No Bid	\$7.96
7	12 oz terry bright stripe, Brand: Medline Item #MDTAB5B41STP	Base	ea	5,400.00	\$2.99	\$3.25	\$7.72	\$6.75
7.1	ALTERNATE OF EQUAL PRODUCT	Option	ea	5,400.00	\$2.99	\$3.25	No Bid	No Bid
Total Extended					\$102,258.00	\$138,369.60	\$213,908.76	\$192,958.32