

														No Award							
YC	16	Windsor Sensor vacuum bag, #MMS300, 10 bags/pk	Base	ea	20			No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		\$ 0.9000	\$ 18.00	\$ 29.9800	\$ 599.60	\$ 1.4800	\$ 29.60	\$ 1.9745	\$ 39.49
	16.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT	Option	ea	20			No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		\$ 16.2800	\$ 325.60	No Bid		No Bid	
GS	17	Bucket, Rubbermaid #2963, Brute bucket, 10 qt; round; gray	Base	ea	2			No Bid	\$ 10.4600	\$ 20.92	\$ 19.3800	\$ 38.76	\$ 4.9500	\$ 9.90	No Bid			\$ 10.2500	\$ 20.50	\$ 14.3000	\$ 28.60
	17.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT	Option	ea	2			No Bid	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid			No Bid		No Bid	
DOC, GS	18	Floor Sign, Rubbermaid #6211-11, multi-lingual "caution wet floor", imprinted on 4 sides, color: yellow, 6/cs	Base	ea	84			No Bid	\$ 23.2700	\$ 1,954.68	\$ 68.1300	\$ 5,722.92	\$ 43.6500	\$ 3,666.60	No Bid			No Bid		\$ 43.4390	\$ 3,648.88
	18.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT	Option	ea	84			No Bid	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid			\$ 10.0800	\$ 846.72	No Bid	
GS	19	34" Replacement Micro Fiber Dust Mop, Filmop #6090116DA, 14/cs	Base	ea	28			No Bid	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid			No Bid		\$ 46.2000	\$ 1,293.60
	19.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT	Option	ea	28			No Bid	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid			No Bid		No Bid	
														No Award							
NM, DOC	20	Broom Handle Proline Brush #BRU136; metal tip; threaded, 60"x15/16" dia, 12/cs	Base	ea	6012	512		No Bid			\$ 6.1400	\$ 36,913.68	\$ 2.6200	\$ 1,341.44	\$ 2.9700	\$ 17,855.64		No Bid		No Bid	
	20.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT	Option	ea	6012			No Bid			No Bid		No Bid		No Bid			No Bid		\$ 6.5890	\$ 39,613.07
DOC	21	Sweep Broom 24", Amsan Renown #REN03947, features fine, medium heavy sweeps into one floor sweep with plastic block	Base	ea	400			No Bid			\$ 5.0900	\$ 2,036.00	No Bid		No Bid			No Bid		No Bid	
	21.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT	Option	ea	400			No Bid			No Bid		No Bid		No Bid			\$ 16.0000	\$ 6,400.00	\$ 31.0530	\$ 12,421.20
NM, GS	22	Lobby Dust Pan Broom, Rubbermaid #6374, 27" handle	Base	ea	52			No Bid	\$ 9.4400	\$ 490.88	\$ 15.3300	\$ 797.16	\$ 7.1000	\$ 369.20	No Bid			No Bid		\$ 12.4660	\$ 648.23
	22.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT	Option	ea	52			No Bid	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid			\$ 5.7600	\$ 299.52	No Bid	
GS	23	Lime Rid Non-Foaming Descale; 1 quart bottles)	Base	qt	14			No Bid			\$ 7.6500	\$ 107.10	\$ 3.1900	\$ 44.66	No Bid			No Bid		\$ 20.6910	\$ 289.67
	23.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT)	Option	qt	14			No Bid			No Bid		No Bid		No Bid			No Bid		No Bid	
GS	24	Hospco Health Guards Toilet Seat Covers, #HOS HG-500, White, 250/Pack, 20 pk/cs	Base	ea	240000			No Bid			\$ 0.0300	\$ 7,200.00	\$ 1.5600	\$ 374,400.00	No Bid			No Bid		\$ 0.0175	\$ 4,200.00
	24.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT	Option	ea	240000			No Bid			No Bid		No Bid		\$ 87.0000	\$ 20,880,000.00		\$ 0.0105	\$ 2,520.00	No Bid	
NM, DOC	25	Spray bottle, Unisan #UNS 32, mix dispense concentrated cleaning products, natural color, plastic bottles have quantity graduations, 32 oz capacity	Base	ea	364			No Bid	\$ 1.0000	\$ 364.00	\$ 1.3100	\$ 476.84	\$ 0.4900	\$ 178.36	No Bid			No Bid		\$ 4.8650	\$ 1,770.86
	25.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT	Option	ea	364			No Bid	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		\$ 0.6900	\$ 251.16		\$ 0.9600	\$ 349.44	No Bid	
NM, DOC	26	Trigger Sprayer, Unisan #UNS 922-9, 9.5", for 32 oz spray btl (must fit item #25 but could be ordered separately)	Base	ea	1264			No Bid	\$ 1.0300	\$ 1,301.92	\$ 1.6500	\$ 2,085.60	\$ 0.5400	\$ 682.56	No Bid			No Bid		\$ 1.2650	\$ 1,598.96
	26.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT (must fit item #25.1 but could be ordered separately)	Option	ea	1264			No Bid	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		\$ 0.7400	\$ 935.36		\$ 0.9600	\$ 1,213.44	No Bid	
Parks	27	Simoniz Almond Pearl Liquid Hand Soap, #CS0215004, 1 gal Btl, 4/cs (Enter cost for one gallon)	Base	gal	12			No Bid			\$ 28.8900	\$ 346.68	\$ 8.4900	\$ 101.88	No Bid			No Bid		\$ 15.3860	\$ 184.63
	27.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT	Option	gal	12			No Bid	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		\$ 4.6000	\$ 55.20		\$ 8.2100	\$ 98.52	No Bid	
NM, GS	28	Carpet Cleaner, Revitalize Carpet Extraction Cleaner, 1 gal, 4/cs	Base	gal	20			No Bid			\$ 23.4300	\$ 468.60	\$ 10.2200	\$ 204.40	No Bid			No Bid		\$ 60.5000	\$ 1,210.00
	28.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT	Option	gal	20			No Bid	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		\$ 6.9900	\$ 139.80		No Bid		No Bid	

GS	43	32" Dust Mop Holder w/ replaceable Velcro straps, Filmop #5278, 10/cs	Base	ea	80	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 83.3690	\$ 6,669.52
	43.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT	Option	ea	80	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
NM	44	Floor conditioner neutralizer Hilliard #HIL00831, 5 oz pouch makes 3 gal, 90 pouches/cntr, 2 cntr/cs	Base	oz	900	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 0.1000	\$ 90.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 47.4930	\$ 42,743.70
	44.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT	Option	oz	900	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
NM, DOC	45	Counter brush, Proline Brush #BRU5308, 13" foam plastic block w/ bi-directional hanging hole, brush face 8", trim 2-5"	Base	ea	152	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 8.9800	\$ 1,364.96	\$ 3.2500	\$ 494.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 12.0450	\$ 1,830.84
	45.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT	Option	ea	152	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
NM	46	Floor burnishing pad; 20" beige, 5/bx	Base	ea	10	No Bid	\$ 5.5100	\$ 55.10	\$ 6.1700	\$ 61.70	\$ 2.9200	\$ 29.20	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 3.7000	\$ 37.00	\$ 17.5890	\$ 175.89
NM	47	Bru-Clean Tbc 2 Effervescent Disinfectant Tablet. Must be US EPA Registered Cleaner-Disinfectant with efficacy against bacteria in biofilms, C. difficile spores, Mycobacterium bovis (TB), and other microorganisms in 4 minutes. Item #161054; 256 tablets/tub, 2tubs/case	Base	ea	11340	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 1.3000	\$ 14,742.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 0.9600	\$ 10,886.40	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 0.4726	\$ 5,359.28
	47.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT	Option	ea	11340	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
NM	48	Laundry Detergent Powder Tide HC; must be low sudsing w/ a fresh scent for use in hot or cold water; 143 oz box	Base	oz	1716	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 0.3300	\$ 566.28	\$ 0.2200	\$ 377.52	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 0.1492	\$ 256.03
	48.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT	Option	oz	1716	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 0.4800	\$ 823.68	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
NM	49	Liquid Fabric Softener Ultra Downy, April Fresh Scent, 103 oz bottle	Base	oz	103	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 0.3000	\$ 30.90	\$ 0.1500	\$ 15.45	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 22.1650	\$ 2,283.00
	49.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT	Option	oz	103	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
NM	50	Dispatch hospital cleaner disinfectant towels w/ bleach RTU #69101, 7"x8" size wipe, 50 wipes/bx, 6 bx/cs	Base	ea	600	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 1.2100	\$ 726.00	\$ 16.6700	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 17.3240	\$ 10,394.40
	50.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT	Option	ea	600	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
NM	51	Comfresh White Air Freshener dispenser #REN03575CT, 12/cs	Base	ea	24	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 44.7100	\$ 1,073.04	\$ 4.3600	\$ 104.64	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 15.3230	\$ 367.75
	51.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT	Option	ea	24	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
NM	52	Renown Comfresh Retail #RLN03583-C1 Mango, 6/cs (must fit item #51 but could be ordered separately)	Base	ea	12	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 8.3800	\$ 100.56	\$ 9.0700	\$ 108.84	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 23.8700	\$ 286.44
	52.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT (must fit item #51.1 but could be ordered separately)	Option	ea	12	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
NM	53	Deb InstantFOAM Complete hand sanitizer, Instant Foam #IFC1U, Alcohol-based foam hand sanitizer topical solution. Must be perfume and dye-free alcohol-based instantFOAM hand sanitizer with moisturizer and skin conditioner. Glove compatible. 1 liter refills, 6/cs.(NO SUBSTITUTIONS)	Base	cs	30	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 86.4600	\$ 2,593.80	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 125.1600	\$ 3,754.80	\$ 17.5450	\$ 526.35	
YC	54	Purel advanced hand sanitizer, 1 liter bag, 4/cs #2156-08	Base	lt	96	No Bid	\$ 9.6500	\$ 926.40	\$ 0.0200	\$ 1.92	\$ 12.3700	\$ 1,187.52	\$ 15.9500	\$ 1,531.20	\$ 14.7800	\$ 1,418.88	\$ 15.0480	\$ 1,444.61
	54.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT (PRODUCT MUST FIT IN EXISTING DISPENSER-PURRELL NXT PUSH DISPENSER #GOJ212006)	Option	lt	96	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
NM, GS	55	Floor Scrubbing pad, Premiere #PAD 4017, 17" blue, 5/bx	Base	ea	1135	No Bid	\$ 3.9800	\$ 4,517.30	\$ 13.4500	\$ 15,265.75	\$ 2.4000	\$ 2,724.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 2.8500	\$ 3,234.75	\$ 3.5590	\$ 4,039.47
	55.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT	Option	ea	1135	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 2.9900	\$ 3,393.65	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

NM	56	Champion Sprayon Furniture Polish, Lemon, 17oz, Aerosol, 12cans/cs Item#CHP5136 (NO SUBSTITUTIONS)	Base	cs	2	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 63.1000	\$ 126.20	No Bid	\$ 35.9000	\$ 71.80	No Bid	\$ 4.8620	\$ 9.72	
NM	57	Utility Brush, Abco #0003 , 8" plastic handle, 3" polypropylene bristles	Base	ea	7	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 5.0700	\$ 35.49	\$ 4.4000	\$ 30.80	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 1.6390	\$ 11.47	
	57.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT	Option	ea	7	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
NM	58	Carpet Cleaner, Revitalize Carpet Extraction Cleaner , 1 gal, 4/cs	Base	gal	8	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 23.4300	\$ 187.44	\$ 10.2200	\$ 81.76	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 60.5000	\$ 484.00	
	58.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT	Option	gal	8	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
NM	59	Crystal Red Stain Plus by Whittaker. Coffee and red stain spotter RTU, 12 oz, 12/cs	Base	oz	288	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 9.0750	\$ 2,613.60	
	59.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT	Option	oz	288	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
										No Award						
NM	60	Crystal Spotter by Whittaker, trigger spotter RTU no VOCs, 22 fl oz, 6/cs (NO SUBSTITUTIONS)	Base	cs	7	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 10.7250	\$ 75.08	
										No Award						
NM	61	Radiator Brush, straight foam Handle, Black Tampico Fill, Weiler Brush Co #73050	Base	ea	4	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 11.1600	\$ 44.64	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 9.5480	\$ 38.19	
	61.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT	Option	ea	4	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
NM, DOC	62	Dust Pan, Rubbermaid #2005 , heavy duty	Base	ea	128	No Bid	\$ 3.3100	\$ 423.68	\$ 8.1600	\$ 1,044.48	\$ 2.1800	\$ 279.04	\$ 4.9800	\$ 637.44	\$ 17.2700	\$ 2,210.56
	62.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT	Option	ea	128	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 3.8600	\$ 494.08	No Bid	
GS	63	Lobby Dust Pan, Rubbermaid #2531	Base	ea	40	No Bid	\$ 15.6300	\$ 625.20	\$ 35.7400	\$ 1,429.60	\$ 9.9600	\$ 398.40	No Bid	\$ 38.2690	\$ 1,530.76	
	63.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT	Option	ea	40	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 7.9800	\$ 319.20	\$ 13.9200	\$ 556.80	No Bid	
NM	64	HOST Extra cleaning sponges, 12 lb bucket, 4/cs (NO SUBSTITUTIONS)	Base	cs	16	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 76.6590	\$ 1,226.54	
										No Award						
NM	65	HOST Extra cleaning sponges, 2.2 lb bag, 12/cs (NO SUBSTITUTIONS)	Base	cs	2	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 1.6170	\$ 3.23	
										No Award						
NM	66	HOST Spot remover for carpet, 32 oz, 12/cs (NO SUBSTITUTIONS)	Base	cs	18	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 14.0470	\$ 252.85	
										No Award						
NM	67	Concrobium Mold Control, Item #625001 - Must be a fungistat, mildewstat and de-odorizer. Must effectively eliminate and prevent mold with no bleach, ammonia or VOCs. Must be safe to use on Drywall, wood, composite wood, plastic, concrete, siding, shakes, metal, brick, stone, tile, grout, stucco, fabric, furniture, upholstery, and flooring. 1 gal, 4/cs Labels and/or labeled 32 oz spray bottles will be supplied at no charge with item award (estimate is 36+/- for the contract)	Base	gal	8	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 29.5000	\$ 236.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 43.7250	\$ 349.80	
	67.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT	Option	gal	8	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
NM, GS	68	Scotch-Brite General Purpose Scouring Pad 96 , (Green) 20/cs	Base	ea	200	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 1.4600	\$ 292.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 1.4570	\$ 291.40	
	68.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT	Option	ea	200	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 0.2300	\$ 46.00	\$ 0.2800	\$ 0.3000	\$ 60.00	No Bid	
NM	69	Scotch-Brite Light Cleansing Hand Pad 7445 , 6"x9" (White) 20/cs	Base	ea	40	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 2.0800	\$ 83.20	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 2.3650	\$ 94.60	
	69.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT	Option	ea	40	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 0.2400	\$ 9.60	\$ 0.6800	\$ 27.20	\$ 2.1300	\$ 85.20	
NM, GS	70	RID® Home Lice , Bed Bug Dust Mite Spray, 5 oz spray can	Base	oz	65	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 5.8080	\$ 377.52	

	70.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT	Option	oz	65		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		
No Award																			
NM, GS	71	Pumie Scouring Stick, UPM12 , Pumice scouring stick that cleans rust, hard water scale and mold stains from porcelain, ceramic tile, concrete and masonry. Stick size: 6"x0.75"x1.25", 12/cs	Base	ea	192		No Bid		\$ 2.2000	\$ 422.40	\$ 3.6000	\$ 691.20	\$ 2.0500	\$ 393.60	\$ 2.9200	\$ 560.64	No Bid	\$ 2.1560	\$ 413.95
	71.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT	Option	ea	192		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		\$ 3.5100	\$ 673.92	No Bid
NM	72	Master Center Dispensing System by Brulin, Black Shadow 4.3.1 (NO SUBSTITUTIONS). Must have bucket fill and bottle fill. To be installed and provided free of charge. Goes with Award of 73, 74, 75, 76 below NOTE: ALL BIDDERS SHALL INCLUDE \$0 FOR THIS LINE ITEM.	Base	ea	0		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		\$ 494.2080
NM, GS	73	Floor cleaner, Brulin Neutral Cleaner #111014, (NO SUBSTITUTIONS) low ph, non-dulling, rinse-free daily use cleaner, 2.5 gal, 6/cs to be used with Item 72 Dispensing System.	Base	cs	22		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		\$ 96.7000	\$ 2,127.40	No Bid	\$ 40.9090	\$ 900.00
NM	74	Heavy Duty "spray-and-wipe" degreaser, Brulin Power #9, ½ gal, 4/cs (NO SUBSTITUTIONS) to be used w/ Item 73 Dispensing System	Base	cs	35		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		\$ 166.3000	\$ 5,820.50	No Bid	\$ 5.8660	\$ 205.31
GS	75	Maxx Concentrate hydrogen peroxide #191007-RD, all facility cleaner, 1 gal, 4/cs (NO SUBSTITUTIONS) To be used w/ Item 73	Base	cs	52	42	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		\$ 192.4000	\$ 8,080.80	No Bid	\$ 26.9550	\$ 1,401.66
NM, GS	76	Brulin Unicide 25b, soft acidic non-alkaline disinfectant 7-in-1 cleaner with broad range germicidal activity, HBV effective Item #161059, 64 oz bt1, 4/cs, To be used w/ Item 73 Dispensing System (NO SUBSTITUTIONS)	Base	cs	108		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		\$ 143.4000	\$ 15,487.20	No Bid	\$ 14.8480	\$ 1,603.58
GS	77	solids content; non-yellowing sealer finish, PH range 8.0-9.0, must contain optically enhanced polymers, UL Approved to meet or exceed static coefficient of friction of 0.5 as determined by ASTM Method D 2047, gloss reading of 93 with	Base	gal	20		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	\$ 193.8640	\$ 3,877.28
	77.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT	Option	gal	20		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		\$ 13.8200	\$ 276.40	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	
DOC, GS	78	Floor Stripper, Spartan Green Solutions Floor Finish Remover, Green Seal Certified, concentrated 6 oz/gal Dilution rate, low odor, PH range of 10.5-11.5; must be formulated to remove Spartan I-shine 25% floor finish, 5 gal pail (Enter cost for one gallon)	Base	gal	520		No Bid		\$ 14.1000	\$ 7,332.00			No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	\$ 133.1000	\$ 69,212.00
	78.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT	Option	gal	520		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		\$ 11.7600	\$ 6,115.20	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	
NM	79	Disinfectant, Spartan Green Solutions 10b; must be EPA Registered, 1:256 Quat Disinfectant Cleaner, pH range of 6.5-7.5, no rinse required, non-alkaline, no color no fragrance, no Metasilicates, Phosphates, nonylphenols, Dye or	Base	oz	8960		No Bid		\$ 16.2800	\$ 145,868.80			\$ 0.3927	\$ 3,518.59	No Bid		No Bid	\$ 45.5790	\$ 408,387.84
	79.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT	Option	oz	8960		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	
YC	80	#3513 ; must be EPA Registered, 1:256 Quart Disinfectant Cleaner, pH range 6.5-7.5; no rinse required, non-alkaline; no color no fragrance, no Metasilicates, Phosphates, nonylphenols, or Dye; must be effective against CA-MRSA, MRSA, VRE,	Base	lt	192		No Bid		\$ 16.2800	\$ 3,125.76			\$ 8.7600	\$ 1,681.92	No Bid		No Bid	\$ 22.5340	\$ 4,326.53
	80.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT	Option	lt	192		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	

GS	91	Microfiber Cleaning Cloth, 70% polyester/30% Polyamide, can be laundered up to 500 times, lint free, Multiple colors: blue, green, red, yellow, orange, white, purple, black, brown, navy, or pink, 16"x16" Microfiber Cloths 49 grams, 180/cs Samples in all colors must be provided	Base	ea	720	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 2.2100	\$ 1,591.20	No Bid	\$ 0.7400	\$ 532.80	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 5.4875	\$ 3,951.00
	91.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT	Option	ea	720	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	\$ 0.7400	\$ 532.80	No Bid			
GS	92	Microfiber Cleaning Cloth, 70% polyester/30% Polyamide, can be laundered up to 500 times, lint free, Multiple colors: blue, green, red, yellow, orange, white, purple, black, brown, navy, or pink 16"x27" Microfiber Cloth 80 grams, 120/cs Samples in all colors must be provided	Base	ea	720	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 0.7800	\$ 561.60	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	\$ 2.9000	\$ 2,088.00
	92.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT	Option	ea	720	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid			
GS	93	Ultra Fragrance Urinal Screen, Amstar Renown #3062, freshens urinal for up to 60 days, releases optimized bacteria that cleans the urinal, eliminates odors reduces splash-back, 10/bx, 60 bx/cs	Base	ea	2400	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 2.0100	\$ 4,824.00	\$ 1.8600	\$ 4,464.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 2.2270	\$ 5,344.80
	93.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT	Option	ea	2400	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	\$ 2.0700	\$ 4,968.00		
YC	94	Solar Salt, American Salt, 50 lb bag	Base	lb	20000	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		\$ 0.1710	\$ 3,420.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 13.6900	\$ 273,800.00	
	94.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT	Option	lb	20000	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	\$ 0.1900	\$ 3,800.00		
YC	95	Sparclean Delimer #SPA7655, pH 1.0-2.0, 1 gal, 4/cs	Base	gal	32	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 8.4400	\$ 270.08	\$ 13.5000	\$ 432.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 27.9000	\$ 892.80	
	95.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT	Option	gal	32	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	No Bid			
YC	96	Mr. Muscle Oven/Grill Cleaner #JDB91206, 19 oz aerosol, 6/cs	Base	oz	228	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 0.6100	\$ 139.08	\$ 0.2900	\$ 66.12	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 6.5900	\$ 1,502.52	
	96.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT	Option	oz	228	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid		\$ 0.2400	\$ 54.72	\$ 0.3070	\$ 70.00	
YC	97	Clothesline Fresh Laundry Detergent, SPA #7005, pH 8.0-9.0, 1 gal, 4/cs, Vendor is to provide, install and maintain three 2-Pump top load laundry dispenser systems, #960100, at no charge for the duration of the contract. Vendor must provide wire rack to mount the dispenser to the wall	Base	gal	96	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 31.6700	\$ 3,040.32	\$ 16.9400	\$ 1,626.24	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 32.2400	\$ 3,095.04	
	97.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT	Option	gal	96	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	No Bid			
YC	98	Clothesline Fresh Colorsafe Bleach 5, SPA #7005-04, pH 2.5-3.5, 1 gal, 4/cs	Base	gal	64	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		\$ 8.1600	\$ 522.24	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 88.2800	\$ 5,649.92	
	98.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT	Option	gal	64	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	No Bid			
YC	99	Clothesline Fresh Chlorine Bleach 4, SPA #7005-05, pH 12.5 - 13.5, 5 gal pail	Base	gal	30	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 6.8300	\$ 204.90	\$ 7.9500	\$ 238.50	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 79.3900	\$ 2,381.70	
	99.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT	Option	gal	30	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	No Bid			
YC	100	Clothesline Fresh Detergent, SPA #7002 or equal, pH 13.5-14.0, 5 gal pail, Vendor is to provide, install and maintain three 3-Pump top load laundry dispenser systems, #960200, at no charge for the duration of the contract. Vendor must provide wire rack to mount the dispenser to the wall	Base	gal	60	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 31.6700	\$ 1,900.20	\$ 18.5500	\$ 1,113.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 118.6200	\$ 7,117.20	
	100.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT	Option	gal	60	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	No Bid			
YC	101	Clothesline Fresh Sour/Softener, SPA #7009, pH 2.8-3.5, 5 gal pail	Base	gal	60	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 157.8000	\$ 9,468.00	\$ 13.1400	\$ 788.40	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 19.0500	\$ 304.80	
	101.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT	Option	gal	60	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	No Bid			
YC	102	Sparclean Pot N Pan Detergent SPA #7656, pH 7.5 - 8.8, 1 gal, 4/cs	Base	gal	16	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 29.8100	\$ 476.96	\$ 12.7500	\$ 204.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 19.0500	\$ 304.80	
	102.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT	Option	gal	16	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	No Bid			

YC	103	Sparclean Warewash Hi Temp Rinse Aid, SPA #7652, 52 pH 1.0-2.0; 1 gal, 4/cs	Base	gal	400	100	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 90.3600	\$ 36,144.00	\$ 20.4400	\$ 2,044.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 41.4400	\$ 16,576.00	
	103.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT	Option	gal	400		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
YC	104	All Temp Detergent, SPA #7650, pH 13.5-14.0, 1 gal, 4/cs	Base	gal	400	100	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		\$ 19.4800	\$ 1,948.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 33.7900	\$ 13,516.00	
	104.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT	Option	gal	400		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
YC	105	Saniwipe Surface Sanitizing Wiper, #NPPQ94384, 100 wipes/cntr, 6 cntr/cs, Wipes must be food based.	Base	ea	28800		No Bid	No Bid	\$ 13.4900	\$ 388,512.00	No Bid		No Bid	\$ 0.1200	\$ 3,456.00	\$ 0.1102	\$ 3,173.76
	105.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT	Option	ea	28800		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
No Award																	
YC	106	Spartan #319503 Sani-Tyze sanitizer ready to use food contact surface sanitizer; 32 oz, 12/cs	Base	oz	768		No Bid	No Bid	\$ 0.1200	\$ 92.16	\$ 0.0828	\$ 63.59	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 3.5000	\$ 2,688.00	
	106.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT	Option	oz	768		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
YC	107	3M 200CC 4"x5 1/2" Scotch-Brite Griddle Screen, 20/pk	Base	ea	400		No Bid	No Bid	\$ 0.5800	\$ 232.00	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	\$ 0.3500	\$ 140.00	
	107.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT	Option	ea	400		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	\$ 0.1700	\$ 68.00	No Bid	
YC	108	Penetrol Dish Soap for Restaurant, #REN02765-MS, 1 gal, 4/cs	Base	gal	32		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 8.8500	\$ 283.20	No Bid		No Bid	\$ 92.8400	\$ 2,970.88	
	108.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT	Option	gal	32		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	\$ 6.9800	\$ 223.36	\$ 5.2400	\$ 167.68	No Bid	
NM	109	Consume Eco-Lyzer Neutral Disinfectant Cleaner, SPA #3297, EPA Reg. No. 5741-24, pH 6.0 - 7.0, 1 gal, 4/cs	Base	gal	16		No Bid	No Bid	\$ 2.1300	\$ 34.08	\$ 16.4000	\$ 262.40	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 94.5500	\$ 1,512.80	
	109.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT	Option	gal	16		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
YC	110	Lite n Foamy Cranberry Ice, SPA #3152, bio-based foaming hand, hair body wash, pH 6.0, 1 gal, 4/cs	Base	gal	384		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		\$ 14.0500	\$ 5,395.20	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 73.0800	\$ 28,062.72	
	110.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT	Option	gal	384		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
NM	111	ShineLine Emulsifier Plus, SPA #0084-05, High performance speed stripper, pH 13.5-13.7, 5 gal pail	Base	gal	20		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		\$ 14.0400	\$ 280.80	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 158.6400	\$ 3,172.80	
	111.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT	Option	gal	20		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
DOC, Gs	112	Spartan iShine, SPA #4055, 25% high solids, durable in low maintenance program and high speed applications, pH 8.0-9.0; 5 gal pail	Base	gal	350		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		\$ 18.2800	\$ 6,398.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 151.6300	\$ 53,070.50	
	112.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT	Option	gal	350		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
YC	113	Green Seal Cleaner - Spartan Bio-Renewables, or #4835; Green Seal Certified, must be able to be used on glass, plastic, and Plexiglas; PH range of 7.5-8.5, concentrated 1:64 Dilution rate, minimum 81% bio based content as certified by an independent USDA authorized laboratory; 2 lt, 4/cs	Base	lt	64		No Bid	No Bid	\$ 11.0500	\$ 707.20	\$ 7.3400	\$ 469.76	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 97.6800	\$ 6,251.52	
	113.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT	Option	lt	64		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
YC	114	Labeled refillable plastic spray bottles with trigger, 18 Bio Renewables Glass Cleaner #9331, 32 oz, 12/cs	Base	ea	768	24	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		\$ 2.4700	\$ 59.28	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 2.2000	\$ 1,689.60	
	114.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT	Option	ea	768		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
YC	115	Labeled refillable plastic spray bottles with trigger, 103 Neutral Disinfectant Cleaner #9493, 32 oz, 12/cs	Base	ea	768	24	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		\$ 2.4700	\$ 59.28	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
	115.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT	Option	ea	768		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	\$ 2.2000	\$ 1,689.60	
YC	116	Labeled refillable plastic spray bottles with trigger, 15 Clean by Peroxy #9247, 32 oz, 12/cs	Base	ea	768	24	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		\$ 2.4700	\$ 59.28	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 2.9600	\$ 2,273.28	

	116.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT	Option	ea	768		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
GS	117	Wet mop echo, #ODL1200L-GR, 4 ply, large loop grain, must be launderable, 12/cs	Base	ea	24		No Bid	\$ 8.0100	\$ 192.24	\$ 9.1000	\$ 218.40	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 12.3400	\$ 296.16	
	117.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT	Option	ea	24		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	\$ 4.0900	\$ 98.16	No Bid	
GS	118	Microfiber dust mop Renown 24" #REN03678-1B , must be launderable, 6/cs	Base	ea	24		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid		\$ 9.1700	\$ 220.08	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 23.5700	\$ 565.68
	118.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT	Option	ea	24		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	\$ 11.8200	\$ 283.68	No Bid	
YC	119	Bob Barker #Z516 Cold Water Soluble Bags, 100/cs	Base	ea	2000		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		\$ 1.3500	\$ 2,700.00
	119.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT	Option	ea	2000		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	
YC	120	Spartan Clean on the Go, Clean by Peroxy, #482002, , 2 liter btl, 4/cs	Base	lt	192		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid		\$ 9.4300	\$ 1,810.56	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 41.6500	\$ 7,996.80
	120.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT-Must be peroxide based, not bleach based	Option	lt	192		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
YC	121	Hookless shower curtain, Bob Barker #5CV3677 , 36"Wx77"L, velcro closure Heavy Duty, minimum 8 oz weight, 2 ply vinyl, tear resistant and flame retardant, Light Green, 2/cs	Base	ea	4		\$ 11.3500	\$ 45.40	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 25.3000	\$ 101.20
	121.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT	Option	ea	4		No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
YC	122	Slip lock laundry nets, Bob Barker #W1824 , 18"x24", white, 2/cs	Base	ea	4		\$ 2.2700	\$ 9.08	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 49.4900	\$ 197.96
	122.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT	Option	ea	4		No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
DOC, YC	123	Super Tampax, Bob Barker #SBTPX500 , 500/cs	Base	ea	604000		\$ 0.1280	\$ 77,312.00	No Bid	\$ 0.2200	\$ 132,880.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 0.2561	\$ 154,684.40
	123.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT	Option	ea	604000		No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	\$ 0.2010	No Bid	No Bid
YC	124	Tampax Pearl Tampons Super Absorbency with BPA-Free Plastic Applicator & Leakguard braid, unscented, 50 ct/pk	Base	ea	1200		No Bid		No Bid	\$ 0.1500	\$ 180.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 0.2152	\$ 258.24
	124.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT	Option	ea	1200		No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	\$ 0.2010	\$ 241.20	No Bid	No Bid
DOC, YC, GS	125	Tampons, Hospital Specialty Co Tampax , 500/cs	Base	ea	602000		\$ 0.1520	\$ 0.1070	\$ 64,414.00	\$ 0.1500	\$ 90,300.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 0.1207	\$ 72,661.40
	125.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT	Option	ea	602000		No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	\$ 0.1600	\$ 96,320.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 0.2010	\$ 121,002.00	No Bid	No Bid
DOC	126	Private Issue Feminine Napkins, Bob Barker #SN , 250/cs	Base	ea	452000		\$ 0.1500	\$ 67,800.00	No Bid	\$ 0.3000	\$ 135,600.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 0.1420	\$ 64,184.00
	126.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT	Option	ea	452000		No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	\$ 0.1900	\$ 85,880.00	No Bid	No Bid
YC	127	Stayfree Maxi Overnight Pads with Wings for Women 28 count/box	Base	ea	1344		No Bid		No Bid	\$ 0.5900	\$ 792.96	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 0.2146	\$ 288.42
	127.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT	Option	ea	1344		No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		\$ 0.2900	\$ 389.76	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
YC, GS	128	Sanitary Napkins, kocnester viaiana #s Stayfree Classic Napkins #25131073 , full size feminine napkins, strip adhesive, folded in half individually wrapped, 250/cs	Base	ea	84750		No Bid		No Bid	\$ 0.3000	\$ 25,425.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 0.2686	\$ 22,763.85
	128.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT	Option	ea	84750		\$ 0.1100	\$ 9,322.50	No Bid	No Bid		\$ 0.1300		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
GS	129	Cloth MF GP 250 GM 12"x12", red, 12 pk, Hillyard #HIL20029	Base	ea	144		No Bid		No Bid	\$ 0.2800	\$ 40.32	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 1.3000	\$ 187.20
	129.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT	Option	ea	144		No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		\$ 0.4200	\$ 60.48	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
GS	130	Cloth MF GP 250 GM 16"x16", green, 12 pk, Hillyard #HIL20026	Base	ea	144		No Bid		No Bid	\$ 1.1400	\$ 164.16	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 1.4100	\$ 203.04
	130.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT	Option	ea	144		No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		\$ 0.6600	\$ 95.04	No Bid	\$ 0.8800	\$ 126.72	No Bid	No Bid
YC	131	Consume liquid natural way, 5 gal pail, SupplyWorks #SPA3102-05	Base	gal	30		No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		\$ 17.5100	\$ 525.30	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 128.7800	\$ 3,863.40
	131.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT	Option	gal	30		No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

YC	132	Auto drain dispenser for Consume liquid natural way, SupplyWorks #SPA920500	Base	ea	2	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 222.1700	\$ 444.34	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
	132.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT	Option	ea	2	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
YC	133	Squeeze Tubes for Auto Drain Dispenser, SupplyWorks #SPA960500	Base	ea	8	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 151.2000	\$ 1,209.60	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
	133.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT	Option	ea	8	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 11.1100	\$ 88.88	
YC	134	Cleaner Tabs for Self-Cooking Center Combi Ovens, Rational Care-Tab #56.00.210 , 100/tub	Base	ea	1200	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 1.3693	\$ 1,643.16	
	134.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT	Option	ea	1200	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
No Award																	
YC	135	Rational Care Tabs for Self-Cooking Center Combi Oven with Care Controls, # 56.00.562, 150/cs	Base	ea	1800	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 0.9520	\$ 1,713.60	
	135.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT	Option	ea	1800	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 1.0008	\$ 1,801.44
No Award																	
NM, GS	136	Scrubbing Sponge, Premiere Pads #PAD 174 , yellow/green, 3.6x6.1x0.7, 20/cs	Base	ea	680	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 1.4300	\$ 972.40	\$ 0.7500	\$ 510.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 0.9980	\$ 678.64	
	136.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT	Option	ea	680	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 0.9490	\$ 645.32	No Bid	
NM, YC, GS	137	Wax Bag for Sanitary Napkin Disposal, Hospeco , 5"x8", 500/cs	Base	ea	131000	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 0.1300	\$ 17,030.00	\$ 0.0351	\$ 4,598.10	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 0.0520	\$ 6,812.00	No Bid	
	137.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT	Option	ea	131000	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 0.0683	\$ 8,947.30	
GS	138	Stripper, Bruilin Terragreen Stripper #BRN361002-07 , 2.5 gal, 2/cs	Base	gal	40	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 128.0000	\$ 5,120.00	No Bid	\$ 118.2400	\$ 4,729.60	
	138.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT	Option	gal	40	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 15.1900	\$ 607.60	No Bid	
NM, GS	139	Bowl Cleaner, Rochester Midland bowl lamer #118112 , cleaning, descaling, derusting and polishing toilets, Must be thickened liquid, 2 oz; 12/cs	Base	oz	3264	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 6.9000	\$ 22,521.60	\$ 0.2146	\$ 700.45	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 5.2990	\$ 17,295.94	
	139.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT	Option	oz	3264	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 0.1180	\$ 385.15	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
GS	140	Cube Truck, Rubbermaid #4619 , metal frame, 600 lb 20 cu ft cap, 48"x34"x36"	Base	ea	4	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 759.2300	\$ 3,036.92	\$ 757.8200	\$ 3,031.28	\$ 890.0000	\$ 3,560.00	\$ 1,208.1200	\$ 4,832.48	\$ 640.9400	\$ 2,563.76
	140.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT	Option	ea	4	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
GS	141	Stainless Steel Cleaner Polish, 3M #14002 , 21 oz can, 12/cs	Base	oz	1764	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 19.7600	\$ 34,856.64	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 1.0900	\$ 1,922.76	No Bid	\$ 12.6600	\$ 22,332.24	
	141.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT	Option	oz	1764	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 0.3101	\$ 547.02	No Bid	
GS	142	Floor stripping pad, 3M #7200 , Open Weave Design, 20" color: black, 5/bx	Base	ea	50	No Bid	\$ 5.6000	\$ 280.00	\$ 13.2400	\$ 662.00	\$ 3.9600	\$ 662.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 7.8500	\$ 392.50	
	142.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT	Option	ea	50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 2.6900	\$ 134.50	\$ 3.7100	\$ 185.50	No Bid	
NM, GS	143	Peroxi II by Spartan RTU Antibacterial Cleaning Power , kills 99.9% of household bacteria (*Staphylo-coccus aureus and Enterbacter aergenes) in 2 minutes, 32 oz, 12/cs	Base	oz	58368	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 0.1200	\$ 7,004.16	\$ 0.0950	\$ 5,544.96	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 4.6150	\$ 269,368.32	
	143.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT	Option	oz	58368	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
NM, GS	144	Bleach, Clorox, 96 oz, 6/cs	Base	oz	24768	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 0.1200	\$ 2,972.16	\$ 0.0338	\$ 837.16	\$ 0.0750	\$ 1,857.60	No Bid	\$ 4.1660	\$ 103,183.49	
	144.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT	Option	oz	24768	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 0.0750	\$ 1,857.60	\$ 0.0330	\$ 817.34	\$ 4.1660	\$ 103,183.49
NM, GS	145	Dermaite Total Foam, 1000 ml #0026F, 6/cs (NO SUBSTITUTIONS) Dispensers will be provided as needed, at no charge with item award.	Base	cs	473	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 12.2900	\$ 5,813.17	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 99.4000	\$ 47,016.20	No Bid	\$ 10.3400	\$ 4,890.82	

GS	146	Dermatone Klean Foam anti-bacterial 1000 ml, Item #0093F, 6/cs (NO SUBSTITUTIONS) Dispensers will be provided at no charge with item award	Base	cs	256		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			\$ 1.4600	\$ 373.76	\$ 107.1000	\$ 27,417.60	No Bid	No Bid		
NM, YC, GS	147	Plastic Spray Bottle; 32 oz translucent with graduations	Base	ea	172		No Bid	\$ 1.0000	\$ 172.00	\$ 1.2700	\$ 218.44	\$ 0.4900	\$ 84.28	\$ 0.6900	\$ 118.68	\$ 0.9600	\$ 165.12	\$ 0.9697	\$ 166.79
NM, YC, GS	148	Trigger Sprayer for 32 oz spray bottle; adjustable polyethylene spray trigger w/ nylon filter; chemical resistant heavy duty w/ viton seal (must fit item #147 but could be ordered separately)	Base	ea	172		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			\$ 0.5400	\$ 92.88	\$ 6.9500	\$ 1,195.40	\$ 0.9600	\$ 165.12	No Bid	
NM, GS	149	Crystal Odor Protein by Whittaker, Stain Odor Remover , effective on organic stains, RTU no VOC's, 12 oz, 12/cs	Base	oz	1296		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			No Bid		\$ 1.7100	\$ 2,216.16	No Bid		\$ 9.9900	\$ 12,947.04
	149.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT	Option	oz	1296		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
NM, GS	150	Clorox Healthcare Bleach germicidal cleaner, hospital grade, #689790, 32 oz Spray bottles, 6/cs (NO SUBSTITUTIONS)	Base	cs	92		No Bid	\$ 71.4000	\$ 6,568.80	\$ 115.6500	\$ 10,639.80	No Bid		\$ 103.0000	\$ 9,476.00	\$ 119.2800	\$ 10,973.76	\$ 13.8300	\$ 1,272.36
NM, GS	151	Clorox Healthcare Bleach germicidal cleaner, hospital grade, Refill #68978, 128 oz btl, 4/cs (NO SUBSTITUTIONS)	Base	cs	144		No Bid	\$ 71.4000	\$ 10,281.60	\$ 162.7500	\$ 23,436.00	No Bid		\$ 116.0000	\$ 16,704.00	\$ 146.0800	\$ 21,035.52	\$ 16.2100	\$ 2,334.24
NM, GS	152	SOS pads , 10/bx	Base	ea	140		No Bid	No Bid	\$ 0.3200	\$ 44.80		\$ 0.2960	\$ 41.44	No Bid		No Bid		\$ 0.4380	\$ 61.32
	152.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT	Option	ea	140		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			No Bid		\$ 2.6900	\$ 376.60	\$ 0.5890	\$ 82.46	No Bid	
NM, GS	153	Flat Urinal Screen Cherry fragrance, Hospital Specialty Co , 12/bx, 6 bx/cs	Base	ea	1224		No Bid	No Bid	\$ 2.0100	\$ 2,460.24		\$ 0.7600	\$ 930.24	No Bid		No Bid		\$ 3.5400	\$ 4,332.96
	153.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT	Option	ea	1224		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			No Bid		\$ 2.8900	\$ 3,537.36	\$ 1.2900	\$ 1,578.96	No Bid	
NM, GS	154	Toilet Bowl Mop, Unisan UNS#160 , 4-1/2" strands of acid-resistant polypropylene; 12" plastic handle	Base	ea	197		No Bid	No Bid	\$ 3.1700	\$ 624.49		\$ 1.1000	\$ 216.70	No Bid		No Bid		\$ 8.9500	\$ 1,763.15
	154.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT	Option	ea	197		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			No Bid		\$ 0.6600	\$ 130.02	\$ 1.5000	\$ 295.50	No Bid	
NM, DOC, GS	155	Toilet Bowl Brush, Rubbermaid #6320 , plastic handle; polypropylene fill, 17"L CANNOT consist of any metal parts	Base	ea	622		No Bid	\$ 5.0800	\$ 3,159.76	\$ 3.9800	\$ 2,475.56	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		\$ 7.6100	\$ 4,733.42
	155.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT	Option	ea	622		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			No Bid		No Bid		\$ 10.2400	\$ 6,369.28	No Bid	
NM, GS	156	Toilet Bowl Brush, Rubbermaid #6310 , plastic handle, polypropylene fill, 14.5" long, color: white, 24/cs	Base	ea	5112		No Bid	\$ 1.5700	\$ 8,025.84	\$ 3.9800	\$ 20,345.76	\$ 2.5900	\$ 13,240.08	No Bid		\$ 1.7200	\$ 8,792.64	\$ 3.4400	\$ 17,585.28
	156.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT	Option	ea	5112		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			No Bid		\$ 2.3300	\$ 11,910.96	No Bid		No Bid	
NM, GS	157	Renown Stain Mark Eraser #REN05143 , 30/cs	Base	ea	420		No Bid	No Bid	\$ 1.2900	\$ 541.80		\$ 1.4600	\$ 613.20	No Bid		No Bid		\$ 1.8480	\$ 776.16
	157.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT	Option	ea	420		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			No Bid		No Bid		\$ 1.1700	\$ 491.40	No Bid	
NM, GS	158	Floor Finish, Spartan I-shine Floor finish #SPA4055 , 5 gal	Base	gal	55		No Bid	No Bid	\$ 30.4700	\$ 1,675.85		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		\$ 151.6300	\$ 8,339.65
	158.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT	Option	gal	55		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			\$ 13.2800	\$ 730.40	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
GS, Parks	159	Cling type bowl cleaner, 24 oz, 12/cs	Base	oz	41184		No Bid	\$ 0.0950	\$ 3,912.48	\$ 0.2200	\$ 9,060.48	\$ 0.0775	\$ 3,191.76	No Bid		No Bid		\$ 14.6500	\$ 603,345.60
	159.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT	Option	oz	41184		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
NM	160	Refresh Azure Foaming Hand Soap, dispenser refill bottle, 1000mL, fresh scent, 6/cs #AZU1L (NO SUBSTITUTIONS)	Base	cs	192		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			\$ 57.3000	\$ 11,001.60	\$ 64.9000	\$ 12,460.80	\$ 80.4000	\$ 15,436.80	\$ 9.2810	\$ 1,781.95

GS	161	Renown Smoke & Odor Eliminator Cleaner, 32oz spray bottle, fresh fragrance, 6/cs, #REN03042-MS	Base	oz	576	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 0.3400	\$ 195.84	\$ 0.0916	\$ 52.76	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		
	161.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT	Option	oz	576	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 3.6700	\$ 2,113.92	
NM	162	Filmop Door Latch with Hiding Key Compartment for Alpha Workstation (housekeeping carts). Item#00005M00272. (NO SUBSTITUTION)	Base	ea	12	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
No Award																	
NM	163	Filmop Door Lock Mechanism for Alpha Workstations complete with hardware (1screw item#30084). Item#00005M00231 (NO SUBSTITUTIONS)	Base	ea	12	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
No Award																	
NM	164	Filmop replacement 4" casters for Alpha Workstations. Item #23011262 (NO SUBSTITUTIONS)	Base	ea	32	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
No Award																	
NM	165	Filmop key for side door for Alpha Workstations. Item #P1909918U (NO SUBSTITUTIONS)	Base	ea	12	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
No Award																	
NM	166	Filmop Single Hooks #60073U (NO SUBSTITUTIONS)	Base	ea	12	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
No Award																	
NM	167	Filmop Double Hooks #60080U (NO SUBSTITUTIONS)	Base	ea	12	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
No Award																	
NM	168	Filmop Clips #60072U (NO SUBSTITUTIONS)	Base	ea	12	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
No Award																	
NM	169	Shaws Pads Toilet Ring Remover - Environmentally friendly cleaner pads for use on Porcelain toilets, Ceramic tiles and sinks. Works on rust, calcium, lime and water residue build up. 2 pads/package	Base	ea	48	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 14.7900	\$ 709.92
	169.1	ALTERNATE or EQUAL PRODUCT	Option	ea	48	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
No Award																	
Total Award								\$ 154,488.98	\$ 92,363.56	\$ 25,340.10	\$ 146,584.87	\$ 139,505.70		0		0	
													No award-Vendor indicated they require minimum order size.		No award-Vendor withdrew bid due to some items out of stock; Would cause shipping delays		